Inchming

Co6T0011
td
From: Angela Nance
To: OGMCOAL
Date: 5/13/2010 2:44 PM
Subject: Fwd: RE: Hiawatha - Funds Transfer

>>> Michael Bruschke <mbruschke@BankofUtah.com> 5/13/2010 2:12 PM >>>
Hello Angela,

I'am Roger Tidwell's assistant writing to confirm that we received the wire transfer this morning.
Thank you,

Michael Bruschke | Trust Administrative Assistant | Bank of Utah
711 S State Street | Salt Lake City, UT 84111
Direct line: 801.924.3607 | Fax: 801.924.3629

Please consider the environment before printing

----- Original Message--—-

From: Roger Tidwell

Sent: Thursday, May 13, 2010 1:59 PM
To: Michael Bruschke

Subject: Fw: Hiawatha - Funds Transfer

----- Original Message -----

From: Angela Nance <angelanance@utah.gov>
To: Roger Tidwell

Sent: Thu May 13 13:03:49 2010
Subject: Hiawatha - Funds Transfer
Hi Roger,

| received confirmation that the wire transfer went through from Chase Bank. Can lalso geta
confirmation from Bank of Utah? An email or fax would work just fine - just something for the file.

Also, it was my understanding that you were going to work on completing a UCC form for Hiawatha Coal
Company and M.B.S.C., LLC - | just wanted to confirm that this is in the works.

Thank you for your help.

Angela Nance
Business Analyst

angelanance@utah.gov




