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0023 Incomipg

From: "Shaver, Dave" <dshaver@coalsource.com> : C6070011
To: "Pete Hess" <petehess@utah.gov> :#: %3'»{'7
CC: "Hibbs, David" <dhibbs@coalsource.com>

Date: 8/4/2009 4:03 PM o~
Subject: RE: N10040

Pete...| have submitted the requisition for the concrete (65 yds) to

plug the two holes ($7500, so Bruce Hill has to approve it. The

requisitions to do the earthwork ($5000 for each site) have been

approved by Dave Hibbs and | am awaiting PO numbers to be assigned. We
are now trying to get bids from the driller who will plug the holes. We

expect to have these numbers by the end of the week so that | can get
requisitions submitted.

Dave

From: Pete Hess [mailto:petehess@utah.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, August 04, 2009 2:05 PM

To: Shaver, Dave

Subject: N10040

Dave...

Please update me with your progress on GVH's #1 and #5. Thanks.




