
 

OGMCOAL DNR <ogmcoal@utah.gov> 

Re: Dugout: CO River Fish Payment 
1 message 

McAbee, Kevin <kevin_mcabee@fws.gov> Tue, Dec 11, 2012 at 3:38 PM 
To: Steve Christensen <stevechristensen@utah.gov> 
Cc: "Birchfield, Alex" <abirchfield@osmre.gov>, vmiller@archcoal.com, Christine Belka <cbelka@osmre.gov>, 
Daron Haddock <daronhaddock@utah.gov>, OGMCOAL DNR <ogmcoal@utah.gov> 

Steve, Alex and all - 
 
Thanks so much for tracking down this payment receipt.  I apologize that our records did not indicate the 
fee was paid.  I will update our and the Recovery Program's records immediately.  This payment happened 
right as I started working here, so apparently it was mis-filed when it came in.  Sorry for the confusion. 
 
Kevin 
 
On Tue, Dec 11, 2012 at 11:46 AM, Steve Christensen >stevechristensen@utah.gov<  wrote: 

Good morning everyone,
 
I dug into our files and managed to find some documentation of the Dugout Canyon Mine CO River Fish 
Recovery payment issue (See attached).
 
It appears that DOGM received confirmation from Carl Johnston (OSM) that the National Fish and 
Wildlife Foundation received a payment of $2,330.49 (dated 9/18/2008) from the Dugout Canyon Mine 
(receipt #651912).  Hopefully this clears things up.  If not, please let me know.  
 
Regards,
Steve
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
--  
Kevin McAbee
Ecologist, Aquatic Endangered and Sensitive Species
US Fish and Wildlife Service
Utah Ecological Services Field Office
2369 West Orton Circle, Suite 50
West Valley City, UT 84119
 
office: 801-975-3330 ext 143
fax: 801-975-3331
 
http://www.fws.gov/utahfieldoffice/
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