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0028
From: Wayne Hedberg
To: cwmining@etv.net; mreynolds@etv.net
Date: 7/14/2005 10:38:05 AM
Subject: Fwd: 07/14/2005 - Outstanding Fines
Mark,

Please see the attached email from Stephanie Dunlap. These are outstanding NOV assessment fines at
Hiawatha and Bear Canyon that still need to be paid. Would you please look into this and make
arrangements to have these paid promptly? Please contact me if you have questions or concerns in this
regard.

Thank you for your immediate attention to this matter.
Sincerely,

Wayne Hedberg

Permit Supervisor

Coal Regulatory Program
Division of Qil, Gas & Mining
(801)538-5286

CC: Pam Grubaugh-Littig; Pete Hess; Stephanie Dunlap



Sheila Morrison - 07/14/2005 - Outstanding Fines Page 1

From: Stephanie Dunlap

To: Angela Nance; Sheila Morrison; Vickie Southwick
Date: 7/14/2005 8:35:43 AM

Subject: 07/14/2005 - Outstanding Fines

The following information is who to expect payment from and how much to expect.

-Hiawatha Mine N05-01-01-01, issued 04/08/2005, terminated 04/26/2005, and pending payment

($484.00)
-Bear Canyon Mine N05-46-1-1, issued 04/15/2005, terminated 04/19/2005 and pending payment

($374.00)

CC: Pam Grubaugh-Littig; Pete Hess; Wayne Hedberg
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