
OGMCOAL - Fwd: RE: AML fees 

  
FYI- 
 
>>> Corey Heaps <CHeaps@rhinolp.com> 3/15/2011 7:21 AM >>> 

Daron, 

Attached is receipt of AML fees payment.  The wire transfer occurred yesterday.   

We are drafting a letter authorizing Hiawatha to have access the portions of the permit area to comply with 
reclamations obligations. 

Thanks, 

Corey 

  

From: Daron Haddock [mailto:daronhaddock@utah.gov]  
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2011 12:19 PM 
To: Corey Heaps; Corey Heaps 
Cc: Dana Dean; Steve Alder 
Subject: Re: AML fees 

  

Corey, 
I received the voice mail you left last Friday.  From it I understand you will make sure the outstanding AML fee 
at the Bear Canyon mine will be paid by March 25th.  I also understand you will be issuing a letter that 
authorizes Hiawatha Coal Company to complete the reclamation work on the South Fork and Middle fork 
areas on land currently controlled by the ANR Operating agreement.    Thank you for your help on this.  We will 
look forward to hearing from you.    
  
  
Daron R. Haddock 
Coal Program Manager 
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining 
(801) 538-5325 

From:    Daron Haddock
To:    Angela Nance;  OGMCOAL
Date:    3/15/2011 7:41 AM
Subject:    Fwd: RE: AML fees 
Attachments:   Rhino AML Fee Payment Confirmation.PDF
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