2/23/2016 State of Utah Mail - Re: FW: Fine Payment Required

Suzanne Steab <suzannesteab@utah.gov>

Re: FW: Fine Payment Required

Daron Haddock <daronhaddock@utah.gov> Tue, Feb 23, 2016 at 7:27 AM
To: Jaren Jorgensen <JJorgensen@rhinolp.com>

Cc: "suzannesteab@utah.gov" <suzannesteab@utah.gov>, "joehelfrich@utah.gov" <joehelfrich@utah.gov>,
"ogmcoal@utah.gov" <ogmcoal@utah.gov>

Jaren,
You are correct. Dana is still in the process of completing findings after the assessment conference. She will
be sending out a revised assessment in the near future. Thanks, Daron

On Mon, Feb 22, 2016 at 10:12 AM, Jaren Jorgensen <JJorgensen@rhinolp.com> wrote:

Suzanne,

I just spoke with Joe Helfrich. He said that these need to be updated. No good faith points are issued as well as the fine is not correct. I will
not submit payment until I get a revised assessment.

Thanks,

Jaren Jorgensen
Engineering

CASTLE VALLEY MINING LLC
5550 W. BEAR CANYON RD
HUNTINGTON, UT 84528
BOX 475
PHONE: 435 687 2178

FAX: 435 687 5037
E-MAIL: jjorgensen@rhinolp.com

From: Suzanne Steab [suzannesteab@utah.gov]
Sent: Monday, February 22, 2016 9:48 AM

To: Jaren Jorgensen

Subject: Fine Payment Required

Please see attached. No hard copy to follow.

Suzanne Steab, Engineering Technician Il
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Daron R. Haddock

Coal Program Manager
Utah Division of QOil, Gas & Mining
(801) 538-5325

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ui=2&ik=458c8c 1bf8&view=pt&search=inbox&msg=1530e87517e58375&sim|=1530e87517e58375
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